
Competitive Bid#WG15-39 Award Listing 
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix 
Effective 10/21/15 to 10/21/16 

AREA 100 Delivered Prices Onl 
Description 

of item Delivered Bidder 

BC-723 $52.00 MAC Prime 

, 	 BC-723 $58.50 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

424A-336 $62.85 MAC Prime 
424A-336 $64.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424A-340 $58.00 MAC Prime 
424A-340 $60.50 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424A-341 $57.25 MAC Prime 
424A-341 $60.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

4248-635 $52.65 MAC Prime 
4248-635 $56.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
4248-636 $50.95 MAC Prime 
4248-636 $54.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424B-637 $47.65 MAC Prime 
4248-637 $54.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

MAC supply location Bay Minette/Saraland 
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile 
Mobile Materials location is Airport Blvd. Minimum 48 bags per order 

	

Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

$14.50 
	

MAC 
Secondary 
	

$19.70 
	

Mobile Materials 

	

Recylce Asphalt (RAP)- Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

No Bid 
Secondary 
	

No Bid 

if the supplier cannot deliver the amount of material needed 
on the day of the order. the County al their sole discretion. may 
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest 
facility most convenient to the job site, whether it is the Prime 
or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By 
doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in 
no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County. 



Competitive Bid#WG15-39 Award Listing 
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix 
Effective 10/21f15 to 10/21/16 

AREA 200 Delivered Prices Onl 
--  - 

Description 
of Item Delivered Bidder 

BC-723 
BC-723 

$52 80 
$57.50 

MAC 
HOSEA WEAVER 

Prime 
2nd 

424A-336 $62.85 MAC Prime 
424A-336 $6300 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424A-340 $58 00 MAC Prime 
424A-340 $59.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424A-341 $57.25 MAC Prime 
424A-341 $58.50 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

42413-635 $52.65 MAC Prime 
4240-635 $54.50 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
4240-636 $5095 MAC Prime 
4240-636 $53.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
42413-637 $47.65 MAC Prime 
4240-637 $53.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

MAC supply location Bay MInettelBaraland 
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile 
Mobile Materials location is Airport Blvd. Minimum 48 bags per order 

	

Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

$14.50 
	

MAC 
Secondary 
	

$19.70 
	

Mobile Maierials 

	

Recylce Asphalt (RAP- Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

No Bid 
Secondary 
	

No Bid 

'lithe supplier cannot deliver the amounl of material needed 
on the day of the order, the County al heir sole discretion. may 
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest 
Facility most convenient to the job sue, whether ills the Prime 
or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By 
doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in 
no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County. 



Competitive Bid#WG15-39 Award Listing 
Bituminous Materials & Hot Bituminous Plant Mix 
Effective 10121/15 to 10/21116 

AREA 300 DelIveredPric es 0 
Description 

of Item Del ivered Bidder 
13C-723 
BC-723 

$56 10 
$6000 

MAC 
HOSEA VVEAVER 

Prime 
2nd 

424A-336 $6550 HOSEA WEAVER Prime 
424A-336 $66 25 MAC 2nd 
424A-340 $61 15 MAC Prime 
424A-340 $62 00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424A-341 $60 55 MAC Prime 
424A-341 $62 00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

424B-635 $55.40 MAC Prime 
424B-635 $57.50 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424B-636 $54 00 MAC Prime 
4248-636 $56.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 
424B-637 $50.40 MAC Prime 
424B-637 $56.00 HOSEA WEAVER 2nd 

MAC supply location Bay Mfnetto/Saraland 
Weaver supply location is Cut Off Road Mobile 
Mobile Materials location Is Airport Blvd. Minimum 48 bags per order 

	

Cold-Mix 50 LB BAG Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

$14.50 
	

MAC 
Secondary 
	

$19.70 
	

Mobile Materials 

	

Recylce Asphalt (RAP)- Delivered 
	

Prime 
	

No Bid 
Secondary 
	

No Bid 

lithe supplier cannot deliver he amount of material needed 
on the day of the order, the County at their sole discretion, may 
choose to pickup, or have delivered material from the nearest 
facility most convenient to the lob site, whether it is the Prime 
or Secondary vendor, at the pickup or delivered price. By 
doing so the County will not violate the Bid Specifications. This in 
no way relieves the bidder from delivering the materials to the County. 



COMPETITIVE BID #WG15-39 Award Listing 
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS 
Area 100, 200, 300 
Picked Up Prices Based on Facility Location Only 

DESCRIPTION 
Mobile Asphalt Co. 

Bay Minette 	Saraland 	Foley 
Hosea 0. Weaver 
Cut off Rd.Mobile 

Mobile Materials LLC 

BC-723 $48.00 $48.00 $52.00 $53.00 No Bid 

424A-336 $57.50 $57.50 $61.50 $57.00 No Bid 
424A-340 $53.70 $53.70 $58.00 554.00 No Bid 
424A-341 $52.00 $52.00 $56.00 554 00 No Bid 

424B-635 $48.80 $48.80 $51.50 $50.00 No Bid 
424B-636 $47.25 $47.25 $50.00 $48.00 No Bid 
424B-637 $45.00 $45.00 $50.00 $48 00 No Bid 

Cold Mix Asphalt - 50 lb bag $1450 $14.50 $14.50 No Bid $15.00 
Bulk by Ton $122.50 

Recycle Asphalt (RAP) $17.50 $17.50 No Bid $16.00 No Bid 

Recycle Asphalt (RAP) Loxley /1-10 Stockpile $17.50 MAC 


