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BID TAB SUMMARY - Widening and Resurfacing Foley Beach Express from CR-12 to End on Maintenance - BCP 0207816 - (10/04/2016) 

Indexed Asphalt Cost: John G. Walton 
- 

H.O. Weaver 	 Mobile Asphalt Co. 

Alternate 1 - All Labor and Material N/A TOTAL: $ 	1,423,345.27 'TOTAL: $ 	1,550,412.50 ITOTAL: 	$ 	1,495,000.00 

Alternate 2 - Four Roads - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix I $ 	 1,140,775.00 Lay Down: NO BID Down: NO BID Lay Down: $ 	271,000.00 

TOTAL: N/A 

'Lay 

TOTAL: N/A TOTAL: $ 	1,411,775.00 

, 
Addendum 1 Yes Yes Yes 

Addendum 2 Yes Yes Yes 

Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes 

Contract Included Yes Yes Yes 

LOW BID (Alternate 1) 
	

271,000.00 Mobile Asphalt Co. 

ENGINEER'S CERTIFICATE: 

I, FRANK LUNDY, P.E., OPERATIONS MANAGER, HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE IS A TRUE AND CORRECT BID TABULATION FOR THE ABOVE REFERENCED PROJECT AND TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE. 



Alternate 1 - All Labor and Material John G. Walton H 0. Weaver Mobile Asphalt Co. 

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT 

405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 10000 $ 	3.25 $ 	32,500.00 $ 	3.50 $ 	 35,000.00 $ 	 3.35 $ 	33,500.00 

407B-000 JOINT SEALANT FOR HOT MIX ASPHALT PAVEMENT MILE 10 $ 	520.51 $ 	5,205.10 $ 	200.00 $ 	 2,000.00 $ 	 0.01 $ 	 0.10 

408A-052 
PLANING EXISITING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) 

(PLANE 1.501 
SQUARE YARD 8000 

$ 	1.43 $ 	11,440.00 $ 	1.40 $ 	 11,200.00 $ 	 1.30 $ 	10,400.00 

410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 $ 	18,675.00 $ 	18,675.00 $ 	15,000.00 $ 	 15,000.00 $ 	 0.01 $ 	 0.01 

424A-360 
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 1/2" MAX/MUM 

AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, HAL RANGE C/D (RATE 165 LBS/SY) 
TON 15500 

$ 	60.17 $ 	932,635.00 $ 	62.30 $ 	 965,650.00 $ 	55.10 $ 	854,050.00 

424B-648 
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1-1/2" 

MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE A/B (RATE 330 LBS/SY) 
TON 7250 

$ 	47.61 $ 	345,172.50 $ 	58.95 $ 	 427,387.50 $ 	48.15 $ 	349,087.50 

600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 $ 	22,100.00 $ 	22,100.00 $ 	41,500.00 $ 	 41,500.00 $ 	179,000.00 $ 	179,000.00 

428A-001 SCORING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT SURFACE MILE 18 $ 	262.50 $ 	4,725.00 $ 	450.00 $ 	 8,100.00 $ 	425.00 $ 	7,650.00 

701C-000 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE MILE 20 $ 	840.00 $ 	16,800.00 $ 	865,00 $ 	 17,300.00 $ 	800.00 $ 	16,000.00 

701C-001 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE MILE 20 $ 	892.50 $ 	17,850.00 $ 	920.00 $ 	 18,400.00 $ 	850.00 $ 	17,000.00 

7030-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FOOT 665 $ 	2.63 $ 	1,748.95 $ 	2.70 $ 	 1,795.50 $ 	 2.50 $ 	1,662.50 

703E-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL LEGENDS SQUARE FOOT 585 $ 	2.63 $ 	1,538.55 $ 	2.70 $ 	 1,579.50 $ 	 2.50 $ 	1,462.50 

740A-000 TRAFFIC CONTROL SCHEME LUMP SUM 1 $ 	12,955.17 $ 	12,955.17 $ 	5,500.00 $ 	 5,500.00 $ 	25,187.39 $ 	25,187.39 

TOTAL: 	$ 	1,423,345.27 TOTAL: 	$ 	1,550,412.50 TOTAL: 	$ 1,495,000.00 

BID: 	$ 	1,422,557.77 BID: 	$ 	1,550,412.50 BID: 	 $ 1,495,000.00 

Alternate 2 - All Labor and Material Except County Shall Provide Plant Mix as Noted by * John G. Walton H 0. Weaver Mobile Asphalt CO. 

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT 

405A-000 TACK COAT GALLON 10000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 3.40 $ 	34,000.00 

40713-000 JOINT SEALANT FOR HOT MIX ASPHALT PAVEMENT MILE 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 0.01 0.10 

408A-052 
PLANING EXISITING PAVEMENT (APPROXIMATELY 1.10" THRU 2.0" THICK) 

(PLANE 1.501 
SQUARE YARD 8000 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 1.30 $ 	10,400.00 

410H-000 MATERIAL REMIXING DEVICE EACH 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 0.01 0.01 

424A-360* 
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE WEARING SURFACE LAYER, 1/2" MAXIMUM 

AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, ESAL RANGE C/D (RATE 165 LBS/SY) 
TON 15500 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 5.65 $ 	87,575.00 

424B-648* 
SUPERPAVE BITUMINOUS CONCRETE UPPER BINDER LAYER, WIDENING, 1-1/2" 

MAXIMUM AGGREGATE SIZE MIX, FSAL RANGE A/B (RATE 330 LBS/SY) 
TON 7250 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 7.70 $ 	55,825.00 

600A-000 MOBILIZATION LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	32,500.00 $ 	32,500.00 

428A-001 SCORING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT SURFACE MILE 18 NO BID NCI BID NO BID NO BID $ 	425.00 $ 	7,650.00 

701C-000 BROKEN TEMPORARY TRAFF1C STRIPE MILE 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	800.00 $ 	16,000.00 

701C-001 SOLID TEMPORARY TRAFFIC STRIPE MILE 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	850.00 $ 	17,000.00 

7030-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MARKINGS SQUARE FOOT 665 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 2.50 $ 	1,662.50 

703E-001 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL LEGENDS SQUARE FOOT 585 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	 2.50 $ 	1,462.50 

740A-000 TRAFFIC CONTROL SCHEME LUMP SUM 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 	6,924.89 $ 	6,924.89 
- 

TOTAL: 	 NO BID TOTAL: 	 NO BID TOTAL: 	$ 	271,000.00 

BID: 	 NO BID BID: 	 NO BID BID: 	 $ 	271,000.00 ' 


