
CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG16-48 
AREA 100 

AWARD LISTING 
Effective 11/01116 through 11101/17 

Grace Stone Aggregates 	II 	JACO 	II M. MARIETTA 	IISUNBELT CRUSHING VULCAN 

PICK-UP 	I DELIVERY PICK-UP I DELIVERY PICK-UP I DELIVERY IIPICK-UP I DELIVERY PICK-UP I DELIVERY! PICK -UP I DELIVERY I PICK-UP I DELIVERY 

Location 105 Industrial Canal Rd West Mobile, ALII 	Evergreen, AL Saraland Wolf Ridge Rd Mobile, AL Foley 	 Bay Bridge 	 Btakeley 
CRUSHED GRAVEL 

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #4 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.50 No Bid No Bid 	6  No Bid No Bid 29.50 37.50 	29.50 37.00 

ALDOT #57 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 37.00 	29.50 37.00 

ALDOT #67 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.50 43.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.50 42.50 	No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #5 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION 
ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 48.50 56.50 No Bid No Bid 	" , No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.50 	47.50 55.00 

ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 45.00 48.50 56.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.50 	47.50 55.00 

ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 58.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.50 	47.50 55.00 

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.50 56.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD. 
2"X0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid U  No Bid No Bid 	a  22.00 No Bid 	U  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid fl 	No Bid No Bid U  No Bid No Bid 	11  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 
825-A 	 24.90 32.90 No Bid No Bid 	I 32.00 40.00 	III  No Bid No Bid 	U  No Bid  _ No Bid 29.50 37.00 	No Bid No Bid 

825-B 	 I 	24.90 32.90 No Bid 26.50 _H 32.00 40.00 No Bid No Bid 	H No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	1 27.20 34.70 

LOW BID PRICE IS INDICATED IN YELLOW 

Low Bid Price is Highlighted in yellow 

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder. 



CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG16-45 
AREA 200 

AWARD LISTING 
Effective 11/01/16 through 11101/17 

Grace Stone Aggregates 	 JACO M. MARIETTA 	H  SUNBELT CRUSHING 	 VULCAN 
PICK-UP 	'DELIVER 	PICK-UP I DELIVERY PICK-UP I DELIVERY if  PICK-UP 1 	DELIVERY 	PICK-UP I DELIVERY PICK-UP 	DELIVERY .I PICK-UP I DELIVERY 

Location 105 Industrial Canal Rd West Mobile, AL 	Evergreen, AL Saraland County Rd 13 	 Foley 
I 	

Bay Bridge Blakeley 
I 

CRUSHED GRAVEL 

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
ALDOT *78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	_ No Bid 	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE 
ALDOT #467 No 	:=_:i:i No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #4 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 37.00 I 	29.50 36.50 
ALDOT #57 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 36.60 29.50 36.50 
ALDOT #67 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 33.50 41.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
ALDOT *89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.50 43.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.50 42.00 	I.  No Bid No Bid 
ALDOT #5 2835 36.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GAB1ON 
ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid - 46.50 	48.50 56.00 No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.00 47.50 54.50 
ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 46.50 	48.50 56.00 4  No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.00 47.50 54.50 
ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	50.00 58.50 No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 47.50 55.00 47.50 54.50 

ALDOT 3X6 GAB1ON STONE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	48.50_ , 	56.00 No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD. 

2"X0 BASE No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 	I  No Bid No Bid 25.00 	I 	No Bid 	I  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid 
RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid 	No Bid No Bid 	I No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid 	I  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 

825-A 	 24.90 

[ 

32.90 I  No Bid No Bid 	II 	32.00 40.00 	U  No Bid No Bid 	I  No Bid No Bid 29.50 37.00 	No Bid No Bid 
825-B 	 24.90 32.90 I  No Bid 27.00 	I 	32.00 40.00 fl 	No Bid No Bid I  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	[ 27.20 34.20 

LOW BID PRICE IS INDICATED IN YELLOW 

Low Bid Price is Highlighted in yellow 

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder. 



CRUSHED AGGREGATES BID WG16-48 
AREA 300 

AWARD LISTING 
Effective 11101/16 through 11/01117 

Grace Stone Aggregates 	fl 	JACO 	H 	M. MARIETTA 	H SUNBELT CRUSHING H 	 VULCAN 
PICK-UP 	I DELIVERY 	PICK-UP I DELIVERY 	PICK-UP r DELIVERY 	PICK-UP I DELIVERY 	PICK-UPI DELIVERY] PICK-UP DELIVERY! PICK-UP I 

Location 105 Industrial Canal Rd West Mobile, AL I 	Evergreen, AL Orange Beach, AL Doc McDuffle Rd 	II 
D ELIVERY 

Foley 	 Bay Bridge 	 Blakeiey 
I  

CRUSHED GRAVEL 
ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
CRUSHED LIMESTONE 

ALDOT #467 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #4 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 37.00 43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 43.00 29.50 42.50 
ALDOT #57 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 37.00 43.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.50 42.50 29.50 42.50 
ALDOT #67 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid 37.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #89 No Bid , No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 34.50 48.00 No Bid No Bid 

ALDOT #5 28.75 36.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED RIP-RAP & GABION , 
. 

ALDOT CLASS 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.50 51.00 60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.50 61.00 ' 	47.50 60.50 
ALDOT CLASS 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 48.50 51.00 80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.50 61.00 ' 	47.50 60.50 
ALDOT CLASS 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47.50 61.00 47.54 60.50 

ALDOT 3X6 GABION STONE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED CONCRETE PROD. 
2"X0 BASE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	II No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid -  No Bid No  Bid 

RUBBLE RIP-RAP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	No Bid 

i 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 	g  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 
825-A 24.90 32,90 No Bid No Bid 	H 	37.00 44.00 	11  No Bid No Bid 	U  No Bid No Bid 29.50 43.00 	No Bid No Bid   

, 	 825-B I 	24.90 32.90 No Bid 29,90  _ H 	37.00 44.00 	g  No Bid No Bid 	H  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 	1 	27.20 40.20 

LOW BID PRICE IS INDICATED IN YELLOW 

Low Bid Price is Highlighted in yellow 

Location and transportation cost to the County was used in determining the prime bidder. 


