BID #WG16-51 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories BIDDERS Dana Safety Supply |Galls, LLC Law Enforcement
Supply
Bid Bond Yes Yes No
SMC #10VS C2 Recessed Panel Coated Poly W/Slotted
Poly Window (Cage) or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: PK0228TAH15SCA 10VS PK0228ITU12 TAH15 SETINA
Amount Bid Each $577.26 $494.67 $599.95
SMC 2015 Tahoe 12vs Exp Metal (rear barrier)
or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: PKO123TAH152ND 12-VS PKO123TAH152ND
Amount Bid Each $287.26 $286.46 $285.00
SMC Window Barrier VS Steel Vertical or equal (est. quantity 6)
Model: WKO514TAH15 VS WKO05141TU12 TAH15 SETINA
Amount Bid Each $165.04 $56.06 $149.00
SMC PB400-15 Push Bumper or equal (est. quantity 6)
Model: BKO534TAH15 PB400-15 BK0535ITU16/TAH15 SETINA
Amount Bid Each $256.13 $239.79 $265.00
SOI EMPS2SMS4M 12 LED Flange Mount
Blue/Amber (est. quantity 6) Model: EMPS2SMS4M SOI EMPS2SMS4M EMPS2SMS4M SOUND OFF
Amount Bid Each $79.55 $96.38 $84.50
SOI NForce Exterior LED Visor Lights 12 LED
Modules 6 Blue 6 Amber 8 Modules (est. quantity 6) Model: ENFWB8A/B No Bid ENFTCDX1208 SOUND OFF
Amount Bid Each $699.00 $610.00
SOI NForce Exterior LED Visor Lights 12 LED Modules
6 Blue 6 Amber 6 Modules (est. quantity 6) Model: ENFWB6A/B No Bid ENFTCDX1206 SOUNDOFF
Amount Bid Each $625.00 $495.00
SOI NForce Exterior LED Visor Lights 12 LED Modules
6 Blue 6 Amber (est. quantity 3) Model: ENFWBS8A/B No Bid ENFTCDGS1206 SOUND OFF
Amount Bid Each $699.00 $473.00
SOI N Force Interior LED Light Stick 8 Modules
6 Blue 6 Amber per Module (est. quantity 6) Model: ENFTCDGS1208 No Bid ENFTCDGS1208 SOUN OFF
Amount Bid Each $570.00 $584.00
WEC PAR 46 Super LED Light 12 VVCD (spotlight bulb)
or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: P46SLC WEC PAR 46 P46SLCX
Amount Bid Each $129.00 $200.00 $185.50
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BID #WG16-51 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories BIDDERS Dana Safety Supply |Galls, LLC Law Enforcement
Supply
Bid Bond Yes Yes No
WEC Blue TIR3 LED Surface MT Head w/clear
Lens or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: RSBO3ZCR WECTIR3 RSBO3ZCR WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $47.00 $42.41 $55.00
WEC Vertex Hideaway LED- Any Color or equal VTX609 B/C/R
(est. quantity 6) Model: VTX609C WEC VERTEX 1 COLOR ONLY WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $55.00 $75.31 $57.00
WEC 6 LED Dominator All LED’s to be Blue
or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: D6BBBBB WEC DOMINATOR D6BBBB WHELEN
Amount Bid Each 285.65 $406.92 $376.50
WEC 295 SL SA 6 Self-contained Siren Switch
or equal (est. quantity 6) Model: 295SLSA6 WEC 295 SL SA 295SLSA6 WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $288.00 $516.92 $246.25
WEC 100 W Compact black siren speaker or equal
(est. quantity 6) Model: SA315P WEC 100 W SA315P WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $145.00 $119.95 $145.25
WEC Strap Kit or equal (est. quantity 6) MKLP83 (Expl) MKLP93 (Tah)
Model: MKEZ93 WEC STRAP KIT INCL W/ LIGHTBAR
Amount Bid Each $40.00 $73.08 $0.00
Free if lightbar Purch
WEC Rear Pillar Outer Edge for Tahoe and Explorer
(est. quantity 6) Model: Tahoe OE45UR6 WEC REAR PILLAR OE45UR (TAHOE
Model: Explorer OE34URS OE34UR6 (EXPLORER)
Amount Bid Each $550.00 $815.38 $723.99
WEC Inner Edge Rear Facing 6 Light Blue
(est. quantity 6) Model: Tahoe RP45 WEC INNER EDGE ISTRAY6 (Veh spec Shroud Inc)
Model: Explorer RP34 REAR FACING 6 $723.99
Amount Bid Each $570.00 $783.33
WEC Inner Edge XLP 12-LT Blue 6 Light Blue WEC INNER EDGE ID45UFX (TAHOE)
(est. quantity 6) Model: IX45UFX XLP12LT ID34UFX (EXPL) WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $599.00 $796.15 $1,182.45
WEC Inner Edge Rear Facing Blue 8 Lights WEC INNER EDGE ISTRAYS8 (VEH SPEDIFIC
(est. quantity 6) Model: IE45VR8 REAR FACING BLUE 8 [SHOUD INC)
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BID #WG16-51 Bid Tabulation

Provision of Police Vehicle Accessories BIDDERS Dana Safety Supply |Galls, LLC Law Enforcement
Supply
Bid Bond Yes Yes No
Amount Bid Each $645.00 $862.31 $799.00
WEC SA315P Siren Spacer w/Bracket (est. quantity 6)
Model: SH315P WEC SA 315P SA315P/SAK1 BRACKET
Amount Bid Each $145.00 $119.95 $145.25
WEC Legacy 48” Light Bar w/Alley’s and Take Downs
Priced 3 ways (est. quantity 6)
o AllBlue Model: GS8BBBB WEC LEGACY GB8SP1 WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $1,468.00 $2,886.15 $1,995.00
e Blue and Clear Model: GB8EEEE WEC LEGACY GB8SP3B
Amount Bid Each $1,999.00 $3,806.92 $2,225.00
e Blue, Amber, Clear [Model: N/A - Not Available WEC LEGACY G382 WHELEN
Amount Bid Each in Color Combo 4782.31 $4,405.00
WEC SILENLRKT1 Lens Kit w/Alley Light
Model: SLENLRK1 WEC SILEBLRK1 SLENLRK1 WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $220.80 $283.08 $263.75
WEC Blue Micron LED/ WEC Blue ION LED (est. quantity 6) MCRNSB (MIRCON)
Model: MCRNSB WEC BLUE MICRON ION-B (ION) WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $65.00 $120.00 $77.00
WEC Liberty Lens retrofit Kit (light bar lens kits) or equal (est. quantity 6)
Model: SLENKT1 RETROFIT LENS KIT SLENKT1
Amount Bid Each $152.40 $195.50 $183.00
WEC H/L & T/L plug-in Flasher or equal (est. quantity 6) SSFPOS16 (TAHOE)
Model: SSFPOSI6 WECH/L & T/L H/L+T/L WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $47.00 $82.31 $77.25
WEC Liberty Il 48” Lightbar IW8BBBB Fully Loaded (est. quantity 6)
Model: IW8BBBB LIBERTY 1W8BBBB IW8BBBB WHELEN
Amount Bid Each $1,415.00 $3,095.38 $1,605.00
WEC Cantrol electronics control box (est. quantity 1) CANWC1 WITH
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Bid Bond Yes Yes No

Model: CANCTL1 No Bid CANWC1 WHELEN

Amount Bid Each $1,190.00 $1,416.00
WEC Carbide electronics control box (est. quantity 1)

Model: CCSRNT4F WEC CARBIDE CCSRN3 WHELEN

Amount Bid Each $998.00 $1,422.31 $995.00
D&R Console (est. quantity 6) 901-012A (Tahoe)

Model: SCR14RS JOTTO 425-6268 0126A (Explorer) D & R

Amount Bid Each $196.00 $504.23 $245.00
D&R Console Plate & Fleet Kit (est. quantity 6) 905-0130A (Tahoe)

Model: 905-0130A JOTTO 425-3704 0125A (Plate only Expl) D & R

Amount Bid Each $78.15 $36.79 $74.99
D&R Triple Outlet 12V Power Accessory (est. quantity 6)

Model: CA-01035 JOTTO 425-2968 140553 D &R

Amount Bid Each $28.50 $34.68 $26.50
D&R Armrest CA-0115 (est. quantity 6)

Model: CA-0115 JOTTO 425-6411 CA-0115D &R

Amount Bid Each $44.95 $82.09 $55.00
D&R Console Face Plates for WEC 295 SLSAG6 (est. quantity 6) Face Plate for 295SLSA6 D & R

Model: 02.0172|ZX753 INC W CONSOLE 0.00

Amount Bid Each $21.50 $34.68 $0.00
D&R Console Face Plates Blanks (est. quantity 6) BLANK FACE PLATES D&R

Model: ALL SIZES ZX753 INC W CONSOLE

Amount Bid Each $10.00 $34.68 $0.00
D&R Console 14” SCR14RS (est. quantity 6) Tahoe: VE137 $504.23

Model: SCR14RS Interceptor: 425-6479 [SCR14RSD & R

Amount Bid Each $196.00 $424.62 $167.99
D&R LT 5200 Laptop Mount (est. quantity 6) 425-5542/AMOD-TAH

Model: LT5200 425-5598 AMOD-INTE D & R LT5200

Amount Bid Each $185.00 $376.15/$380.75 $229.00
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D&R Universal Laptop Tray (est. quantity 6)

Model: 907-0039 PRICED WITH LAPTOP |UNI LAPTOP TRAY D&R

Amount Bid Each $48.00| MOUNT $74.25
D&R Space Plate for Console All Sizes (est. quantity 6)

Model: All Sizes FLMNT 11-29-29 LENGTHS D&R

Amount Bid Each $10.00 $47.50
D&R 905-0130A (Console Feet) or equal (est. quantity 6)

Model: LGSUBO6 905-0130A (TAHOE) D & R

Amount Bid Each $56.00 $74.99
Magnetic Mic Holders (est. quantity 12)

Model: MMSU1 JOTTO DESK 425-3816 |[MMSU11 CHIEF/INNOVATIVE PROD

Amount Bid Each $28.60 $32.05 $29.99
Setina W Gun Rack with 1 Black Rack Mounty and 1 Shotgun Lock TUFLOC DS 108DL SMC GK 11191B1SHKSVSCA
(est. quantity 78) SMC GK11191B1SHKSVSCA Model: GK11191B1SHKSVSCA [HK/DUAL RACK SETINA

Amount Bid Each $628.45 $299.96 $705.00
HG2 runners 62” with controller for 2017 Ford Interceptor HG22PC62BB/ HG22PC62BB
Utility (est. quantity 3) Model: HG2-L BRACKET TCRH55 HG2 W/BRACKETRY

Amount Bid Each $595.00 $1,715.38 $625.50
HG2 runners 62” with controller for 2017 Chev Tahoe (est. quantity 3) HG22PC62BB

Model: HG22PC62BB TCRH55 HG2 W/BRACKETRY

Amount Bid Each $555.00 $1,726.92 $625.50

Notes:

Galls, LLC submitted vehicle sheet.

Tahoe

VE137 TAH - JOTTO 425-62168 LOCKING CONSOLE

VE382 - JOTTO 425-3704 ABS PLASTIC DUAL CUPHOLDER
VEO0O2 - JOTTO 425-6411 ADJUSTABLE ARM REST

ZX753 - JOTTO 425-2968 THREE HOLE OUTLET FACEPLATE

425-5542/AMOD - JOTTO CONSOLE SIDE MOUNT W/UNIV LOCKING TOP

2017 Police Interceptor Utility
425-6479 - JOTTO PI UTILITY CONSOLE
VEOO2 - JOTTO 425-6411 ADJUSTABLE ARM REST

$504.23
$36.79
$82.09
$34.68
$376.15

$424.62
$82.09
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ZX753 - JOTTO 425-2968 THREE HOLE OUTLET FACEPLATE $34.68

425-5598/AMOD - JOTTO CONSOLE SIDE MOUNT W/UNIV LOCKING TOP $380.75

2016 Ford F250

VES558 - JOTTO 425-6445 20' CONSOLE WITH LOCK BOX $440.71

ZA1251 - JOTTO 425-6133 FLOOR PLATE $135.17

VE382 - JOTTO 425-3704 ABS PLASTIC DUAL CUPHOLDER $36.79

VEOO2 - JOTTO 425-6411 ADJUSTABLE ARM REST $82.09

ZAX753 - JOTTO 425-2968 THREE HOLE OUTLET FACEPLATE $34.68

425-5542/AMOD - JOTTO CONSOLE SIDE MOUNT W/UNIV LOCKING TOP $376.15
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