COMPETITIVE BID #WG17-02 Bid Tabulation

Pipe, Concrete - Circular & Arch

Delivered Picked Up | Delivered/Picked Up Delivered/Picked Up
Description Forterra Forterra Consturction Materials| Alabama Pipe & Supply
of ltems Amount Amount Amount Amount
15" RCP C-3 $10.60 $10.00 $12.25 $10.50
15" BEVELED END SECTION $28.00 $28.00 No Bid $43.75
18" RCP C-3 $11.60 $11.00 $14.80 $11.25
18" BEVELED END SECTION $30.00 '$30.00 No Bid $45.87
21" RCP C-3 $17.75 $17.00 No Bid No Bid
24" RCP C-3 $19.60 $19.00 $22.25 $18.75
24" BEVELED END SECTION $43.25 $43.25 No Bid $59.62
27" RCP C-3 $26.50 $26.00 No Bid No Bid
30" RCP C-3 $27.25 $26.50 $31.92 $27.00
30" BEVELED END SECTION $61.25 $61.25 No Bid No Bid
36" RCP C-3 $39.25 $38.50 $43.32 $38.00
36" BEVELED END SECTION $97.87 $97.80 No Bid No Bid
42" RCP C-3 $49.25 $48.50 $57.00 $49.00
48" RCP C-3 $64.50 $64.00 $74.10 $64.00
54" RCP C-3 $79.00| $78.50 $94.62 No Bid
60" RCP C-3 $96.00 $95.50 $115.14 $85.00
66" RCP C-3 $126.75] $126.75 No Bid No Bid
72" RCP C-3 $134.50 $134.50 $189.24 $130.00
84" RCP C-3 $182.00 $182.00 $262.00 No Bid|
96" RCP C-3 $430.00 $430.00 No Bid $320.00
18"x11" RCP C-3 ARCH $19.50 $19.00 $19.20 $19.00
18"X11" BES $52.00 $51.50 No Bid $54.50
22"X13" RCP C-3 ARCH $20.50 $20.00 $22.80 $20.00
22"X13 BES $54.00 $54.00 No Bid $60.12
29"X18" RCP C-3 ARCH $27.50 $27.00 $33.00 $27.00
29"x18" BES $68.00 $68.00 No Bid $62.00
36"x23" RCP C-3 ARCH $33.50 $33.00 $46.80 $33.00
36"X23" BES $80.37 $80.37 No Bid No Bid
44"x27" RCP C-3 ARCH $46.50 $46.00 $62.40 $46.00
44"X27" BES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51"x31" RCP C-3 ARCH $60.50 $60.50 $82.80 $60.00
58" X 36" RCP C-3 ARCH $76.50 $76.15 $105.60 $75.00
65" X40" RCP C-3 ARCH $93.50 $93.50 $129.60 $90.00
73"X45" RCP C-3 ARCH $116.50 $116.50 $160.80 $115.00
88"X54" RCP C-3 ARCH $230.00 $230.00 $210.00 No Bid




Competitive Bid # WG17-02 Bid Tabulation
Provision of High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe

Construction Ferguson Ferguson Waterworks
Evans & Company, Inc Matrials Waterworks Recycled Materials
Picked Up IDe!ivered Picked Up |De|ivered Picked-UP Delivered Picked-UP |Delivered
High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe | ASTM Specifications ASTM Specifications
Diameter Gage Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount Amount
4" - $1.95 $1.95 $1.30 $1.30 $1.10 $1.12 $1.10 $1.10
6" $3.20 $3.20 $2.65 $2.65 $2.33 $2.38 $2.33 $2.33
8" $4.15 $4.15 $3.95 $3.95 $3.23 $3.30 $3.23 $3.23
10" $5.05 $5.05 $5.20 $5.20 $4.28 $4.40 $4.28 $4.28
12" $5.75 $5.75 $5.85 $5.85 $5.24 $5.40 $5.24 $5.24
15" $6.75 $6.75 $7.48 $7.48 $6.71 $6.85 $6.71 $6.71
18" $8.60 $8.60 $9.23 $9.23 $8.30 $8.48 $8.30 $8.30
24" $14.80 $14.80 $16.35 $16.35 $14.70 $15.02 $14.70 $14.70
30" $20.10 $20.10 $23.51 $23.51 $21.11 $21.57 $21.11 $21.11
36" $27.75 $27.75 $31.14 $31.14 $27.96 $28.57 $27.96 $27.96
42" $35.50 $35.50 $41.10 $41.10 $36.91 $37.72 $36.91 $36.91|
48" $47.00 $47.00 $49.44 $49.44 $44.39 $45.36 $44.39 $44.39




Competitive Bid #WG17-02 Bid Tabulation
Pipe - Corrugated Round & Arch Bituminous Coated (Metal)

Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (2.66")

BIDDERS:

Construction
Materials

Evans and Company

Corrugated Round and Arch Bituminous

Coated (Metal) Picked Up Delivered| Picked Up| Delivered
6" 16 $6.85 $6.85 $11.10 $11.10
8" 16 $8.19 $8.19 $11.50 $11.50

10" 16 $9.55 $9.55 $12.50 $12.50
12" 16 $12.78 $12.78 $9.75 $9.75
15" 16 $15.34 $15.34 $12.10 $12.10
18" 16 - $19.17 $19.17 $15.20 $15.20
21" 16 $21.72 $21.72 $16.50 $16.50
24" 16 $24.28 $24.28 $19.98 $19.98
30" 16 $30.74 $30.74 $24.95 $24.95
36" 16 $37.06 $37.06 $29.85 $29.85
42" 16 $43.46 $43.46 $35.10 $35.10
48" 16 $48.57 $48.57 $40.15 $40.15
15" 14 $19.18 $19.18 $15.50 $15.50
18" 14 $23.01 $23.01 $18.60 $18.60
21" 14 $31.95 $31.95 $21.10 $21.10
24" 14 $30.68 $30.68 $24.65 $24 65
30" 14 $38.34 $38.34 $30.65 $30.65
36" 14 $46.00 $46.00 $36.50 $36.50
42" 14 $53.68 $53.68 $42.75 $42.75
48" 14 $61.35 $61.35 $49.95 $49.95
54" 14 $69.01 $69.01 $59.50 $59.50
21" 12 No Bid No Bid $27.98 $27.98
24" 12 $42.17 $42.17 $33.01 $33.01
30" 12 $52.40 $52.40 $39.75 $39.75
36" 12 $62.62 $62.62 $50.75 $50.75
42" 12 $72.85 $72.85 $59.00 $59.00
48" 12 $83.07 $83.07 $69.00 $69.00
54" 12 $93.30 $93.30 $81.00 $81.00
60" 12 $103.52 $103.52| $110.00f $110.00
66" 12 $113.75 $113.75| $126.00 $126.00
72" 12 No Bid NoBid| $139.75| $139.75
78" 12 No Bid NoBid| $174.90| $174.90
36" 10 No Bid No Bid $69.25 $69.25
42" 10 $92.08 $92.08 $77.25 $77.25
48" 10 $104.80 $104.80 $89.90 $89.90
54" 10 $117.59 $117.59| $103.00) $103.00
60" 10 $131.64 $131.64| $110.00] $110.00
66" 10 $144.42 $144.42| $126.00f $126.00
72" 10 $157.21 $157.21 $139.75| $139.75
78" 10 No Bid NoBid| $174.90| $174.90
84" 10 No Bid NoBid| $195.00 $195.00
90" 10 No Bid No Bid| $207.00f $207.00
96" 10 No Bid No Bid| $217.00f $217.00
48" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




60" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" 8 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ap" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96" 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Picked Up Delivered| Picked Up| Delivered
Size Gage
17TX13 16 $16.41 $16.41 $13.55 $13.55
21x15 16 $20.51 $20.51 $16.25 $16.25
24x18 16 $23.22 $23.22 $21.45 $21.45
28x20 16 $25.99 $25.99 $21.45 $21.45
35x24 16 $32.83 $32.83 $26.75 $26.75
42x29 16 $39.66 $39.66 $31.95 $31.95
49x33 18 $46.50 $46.50 $39.95 $39.95
57x38 16 $51.96 $51.96 $46.00 $46.00
17X13 14 $20.51 $20.51 $16.75 $16.75
21x15 14 $24.62 $24.62 $19.90 $19.90
24x18 14 $28.72 $28.72 $22.50| $22.50
28x20 14 $32.83 $32.83 $26.38 $26.38
35x24 14 $41.03 $41.03 $32.80 $32.80
42x29 14 $49.23 $49.23 $39.05 $39.05
49x33 14 $57.43 $57.43 $45.75 $45.75
57x38 14 $65.64 $65.64 $53.50 $53.50
64x43 14 $73.85 $73.85 $64.00 $64.00
24x18 12 No Bid No Bid $29.95 $29.95
28x20 12 $45.12 $45.12 $35.40 $35.40
35x24 12 $56.07 $56.07 $42.50 $42.50
42x29 12 _$67.01 $67.01 $54.50 $54.50
49x33 12 $77.95 $77.95 $63.00 $63.00
57x38 12 $88.89 $88.89 $74.00 $74.00
64x43 12 $99.83 $99.83 $87.00 $87.00
71x47 12 $110.77 $110.77]  $120.00] $120.00
77x52 12 $121.71 $121.77)  $134.90] $134.90
42x29 10 $84.79 $84.79 $74.10 $74.10
49x33 10 $98.46 $98.46 $82.75 $82.75
57x38 10 $112.14 $112.14 $96.20 $96.20
64x43 10 $125.81 $125.81] $110.25f $110.25
71x47 10 $140.85 $140.85) $118.00f $118.00
77x52 10 $154.53 $154.53| $135.00] $135.00
83x57 10 $168.21 $168.21 $149.50] $149.50
57x 38 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
64x43 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
71x47 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
77x52 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83x57 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (5"X1" Corrugation)

Picked Up Delivered| Picked Up| Delivered

Size " Gage '
36 16 No Bid No Bid $29.85 $29.85
42 16 No Bid No Bid $35.10 $35.10




48 16 No Bid No Bid $40.15 $40.15
54 16 $67.62 $67.62 $59.50 $59.50
60 16 $74.39 $74.39| $110.00] $110.00
66 16 $84.14 $84.14| $126.00] $126.00
72 16 $92.58 $92.58| $135.00] $135.00
78 16 $99.55 $99.55( $170.00] $170.00
84 16 $107.96 $107.96] $190.00] $190.00
28 16 $121.99 $121.99] $210.00] $210.00
36 14 No Bid No Bid $36.50 $36.50
42 14 No Bid No Bid $42.75 $42.75
48 14 No Bid No Bid $49.95 $49.95
54 14 $75.68 $75.68 $59.50 $59.50
60 14 $83.14 $83.14| $110.00 $110.00
66 14 $91.82 $91.82] $126.00] $126.00
72 14 $100.50 $100.50] $139.00| $139.00
78 14 $107.95 $107.95] $174.00] $174.00
84 14 $116.64 $11664| $190.00/ 3$190.00
g0 14 $124.08 $124.08| $205.00] $205.00
96 14 $132.77 $132.77]  $210.00] $210.00
36 12 No Bid No Bid $50.75 $50.75
42 12 No Bid No Bid $59.00 $59.00
48 12 No Bid No Bid $68.00 $68.00
54 12 $102.98 $102.98 $80.00 $80.00
60 12 $114.15 $114.15]  $110.00f $110.00
66 12 $125.32 $125.32]  $126.00] $126.00
72 12 $136.50 $136.50] $130.00] $130.00
78 12 $147.67 $14767|  $170.00{ $170.00
84 12 $158,83 $158.83] $190.00 $190.00
20 12 $192.10 $192.10] $205.00| $205.00
96 12 $206.11 $206.11 $210.00) $210.00
102 12 $217.33 $217.33]  $210.00| $210.00
108 12 $231.36 $231.36| $212.00f $212.00
114 12 $243.90 $243.90{ $260.00] $260.00
120 12 $256.60 $256.60{ $265.00] $265.00
48 10 No Bid No Bid $89.90 $89.90
54 10 $143.36 $143.36| $103.00] $103.00
60 10 $159.80 $159.60| $110.00;f $110.00
86 10 $180.89 $180.89] $126.00| $126.00
72 10 $196.30 $196.30] $139.75| $139.75
78 10 $213.12 $213.12]  $174.90] $174.90
84 10 $229.95 $229.95| $195.00] $195.00
20 10 $245.37 $246.37] $207.00] $207.00
96 10 $263.60 $263.60] $217.00] $217.00
102 10 $277.62 $277.62]  $220.00{ $220.00
108 10 $295.85 $205.85| $235.00] $235.00
114 10 $311.29 $311.29]  $240.00| $240.00
120 10 $328.10 $328.10| $270.00| $270.00
126 10 $346.33 $346.33 No Bid No Bid
132 10 $363.15 $363.15 No Bid No Bid
138 10 $378.59 $378.59 No Bid No Bid
144 10 $395.40 $395.40 No Bid No Bid
60 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




78 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (5"X1" Corrugation)
Picked Up Delivered| Picked Up| Delivered
Size " Gage

40x31 16 No Bid No Bid $31.95 $31.95
46x36 16 No Bid No Bid $39.95 $39.95
53x41 16 No Bid No Bid $46.00 $46.00
60x46 16 No Bid No Bid $64.00 $64.00
66x51 16 No Bid No Bid $87.00 $87.00
73x55/ 16 No Bid NoBid] $120.00f $120.00
81x59 16 No Bid No Bid| $129.50| $129.50
87x63 16 No Bid No Bid] - $130.00| $130.00
95x64 16 No Bid NoBid] $135.00 $135.00
103x71 16 No Bid NoBid| $143.00] $143.00
112x75 16 No Bid No Bid| $180.00| $180.00
40x31 14 No Bid No Bid $36.75 $36.75
46x36 14 No Bid No Bid $45.80 $45.80
53x41 14 No Bid No Bid $49.75 $49.75
60x46 14 No Bid No Bid $59.38 $59.38
686x51 14 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $65.00
73x55 14 Ne Bid No Bid $70.25 $70.25
81x59 14 No Bid No Bid $65.01 $65.01
87x63 14 No Bid No Bid $79.50 $79.50
95x67 14 No Bid No Bid $85.50 $85.50
103x71 14 No Bid No Bid $97.75 $97.75
112x75 14 No Bid No Bid] $144.00| $144.00
53x41 12 No Bid No Bid $83.00 $63.00
60x46 12 $120.12 $120.12 $74.00 $74.00
66x51 12 $133.15 $133.15 $87.00 $87.00
73x55 12 $151.53 $151.53| $130.00] $130.00
81x59 12 $165.03 $165.03] $135.00f $135.00
87x63 12 $178.55 $178.551  $142.70] $142.70
95x67 12 $192.05 $192.05f $161.00 $181.00
103x71 12 $205.54 $205.54] $170.50| $170.50
112x75 12 $220.55 $220.55| $171.00) $171.00
147x79 12 $232.54 $232.54] $179.00] $179.00
128x83 12 $247 55 $247.55] $186.00[ $186.00
137x87 12 $261.05 $261.05] $197.00] $197.00
142x91 12 $274.56 $274.56] $250.00( 3$250.00

Size "
81x59 10 $210.04 $210.04] $154.00[ $154.00
87x63 10 $228.05 $228.05| $174.95| $17495
95x67 10 $246.05 $246.05| $180.00] $180.00
103x71 10 $262.56 $262.56) $196.00f $196.00
112x75 10 $282.06 $282.06] $206.85| $206.65
117x79 10 $297.06 $297.06| $210.00] $210.00




128x83 10 $316.56 $316.56] $218.00] $218.00
137x87 10 $333.07 $333.07{ $263.00f $263.00
142x91 10 $351.08 $351.08] $292.00) $292.00
66x51 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
73x55 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81x59 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
87x83 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
95x64 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
103x71 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
112x75 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
117%79 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
128x83 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
137x87 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
142x91 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Supply Locations:




