
COMPETITIVE BID #WG17-02 Bid Award 
Pipe, Concrete - Circular & Arch 

Effective Date: 12/06/16 through 12/06/17 

Delivered 
Description 	 Forterra 

of Items 	 Amount 

Picked Up 
Forterra 
Amount 

Delivered/Picked Up 
Consturction Materials 

Amount 

Delivered/Picked Up 
Alabama Pipe & Supply 

Amount 
15" RCP C-3 $10.00 Delivered $10.50 

15" BEVELED END SECTION $28.00 $28.00 
18" RCP C-3 $11.00 Delivered $11.25 

18" BEVELED END SECTION $30.00 $30.00 
21" RCP C-3 $17.75 $17.00 
24" RCP C-3 $18.75 

24" BEVELED END SECTION $43.25 $43.25 
27" RCP C-3 $26.50 $26.00 
30" RCP C-3 $26.50 Delivered $27.00 

30" BEVELED END SECTION $61.25 $61.25 
36" RCP C-3 $38.00 

36" BEVELED END SECTION $97.87 $97.80 
42" RCP C-3 $48.50 Delivered $49.00 
48" RCP C-3 $64.00 Delivered $64.00 
54" RCP C-3 $79.00 $78.50 
60" RCP C-3 $85.00 
66" RCP C-3 $126.75 $126.75 
72" RCP 0-3 $130.00 
84" RCP C-3 $182.00 $182.00 
96" RCP C-3 $320.00 

18"x11" RCP C-3 ARCH $19.00 Delivered $19.00 
18"X11" BES $52.00 $51.50 

22"X13" RCP C-3 ARCH $20.00 Delivered $20.00 
22"X13 BES $54.00 $54.00 

29"X18" RCP C-3 ARCH $27.00 Delivered $27.00 
29"x18" BES $62.00 

36"x23" RCP C-3 ARCH $33.00 Delivered $33.00 
36"X23" BES $80.37 $80.37 

44"x27" RCP C-3 ARCH $46.00 Delivered $46.00 
44"X27" BES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

51"x31" RCP C-3 ARCH $60.00 
58" X 36" _RCP C-3 ARCH $75.00 
65" X40" RCP C-3 ARCH $90.00 
73"X45" RCP C-3 ARCH $115.00 
88"X54" RCP C-3 ARCH $210.00 



Competitive Bid # WG17-02 Bid Award 
Provision of High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe 
Effective Date: 12106116 through 12/06/17 

Evans & Company, Inc 
Ferguson 

Waterworks 

High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Pipe 
Picked Up 
ASTM Specifications 

'Delivered Picked-UP Delivered 

Diameter Gage Amount Amount Amount Amount 
4" $1.10 $1.12 
6" $2.33 $2.38 
8" $3.23 $3.30 

10" $4.28 $4.40 
12" $5.24 $5.40 
15" $6.75 $6.71 
18" $8.30 $8.48 
24" $14.80 $14.70 
30" $20.10 $20.10 
36" $27.75 $27.75 
42" $35.50 $35.50 
48" $44.39 $45.36 



Competitive Bid #WG17-02 Award Listing 
Pipe - Corrugated Round & Arch Bituminous Coated (Metal) 
Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (2.66") 
Effective Date: 12106/16 through 12/06117 

BIDDERS: 
	

Construction 
	

Evans and Company I 
Materials 

Corrugated Round and Arch Bituminous 
Coated  (Metal) Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered 

6" 16 $6.85 $6.85 

8" =ME $8.19 $8.19 
10" 16 $9.55 $9.55 
12" 16  MMIIII $9.75 $9.75 
15" 16  IMINMIll $12.10 $12.10 
18" MI= ME= $15.20 $15.20 
21" 16 IIIIMIIMIIIIIMIM $16.50 $16.50 
24" 16  =MIN $19.98 $19.98 

30" M1=1[13 $24.95 $24.95 
36" 16 $29.85 $29.85 
42" 16IIIIIII $35.10 $35.10 
48" 16 $40.15 $40.15 

15" 14 $15.50 $15.50 
18" 14 $18.60 $18.60 
21" 14 1111111=111 $21.10 $21.10 
24" 14 .11.11111. $24.65 $24.65 
30" 14  IIIIIIII $30.65 $30.65 
36" 14  IIIIMIE $36.50 $36.50 
42" MI= MEM $42.75 

48" MIMI MM. $49.95 $49.95 
54" 14 11=11111. $59.50 $59.50 

.111.11111MIIMI MEI 
21.  MEE' $27.98 $27.98 
24" IIMMLEI EMI. $33.01 $33.01 
30" Fl 

 
$39.75 $39.75 

36" 12  111.1111M $50.75 $50.75 
42" MIMEIIIMIIMIIIMIIM $59.00 $59.00 
48" =NEB =mil $69.00 $69.00 
54" 12  MM. $81.00 $81.00 
60" 12 $103.52 $103.52 MEM 
66" 12 $113.75 =UM 
72" 12 $139.75 $139.75 
78" 12=1MM $174.90 $174.90 

36" 10 1MM. $69.25 $69.25 
42" 10 1.111111 MEM $77.25 
48" 10 $89.90 $89.90 
54" 10 11111=111 $103.00 $103.00 
60" 10 MEM $110.00 $110.00 
66" 10 111=1.11 $126.00 $126.00 
72" 10 IIIMIIIII $139.75 $139.75 
78" 10 $174.90 $174.90 
84" 10  IIIMMI $195.00 $195.00 
90" 10 $207.00 $207.00 
96" 10  MIIMMI $217.00 $217.00 

EMI. 
IIIIIII 

IIM=111 
No Bid No Bid 48" 8  

54" 8 No Bid No Bid 



60" !MINE IIMIIIIII No Bid No Bid 
66' 8  MM. No Bid No Bid 
72" 8 .111111.11111=1111111 No Bid No Bid 
78" IIIIIIME MIIIIIIII No Bid No Bid 
84" •11111111•31111=111 No Bid No Bid 
90" IIIIIMIIIUMIIIMIIIIIIIIIIII No Bid NO Bid 96" 8 IIIIMIIIIIIMIIIMM No Bid No Bid 

IMIIII IIIIIMIIIIMIIII 
MI= Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered 

Size Gage MIIIIMIIMMIlli 
17X13 

28x20 

21 x15 1=1111103■1111 
24x18 111MIE11

UMW 

16 IIIIIIMIIIIIIMIIIIIM 
=.11111111111111111111MKEI 

IIIIIIIMI $13.55 $13,55 
$16.25 

$21.45 

$16.25 
$21 . 45  
$21.45 

36x24 IIIME1 IIIIIIMII $26.75 $26.75 
42x29 11111.103111.1.1111 $31.95 $31.95 
49x33 16 11111111111.111M11111 $30 - 95  $39 . 95  57x38 IIIIIIIIMECMIMIIIIIAIIIIIIM $46.00 $46.00 

IIIIIIIIMIIIIIIIIIMIIIIIMIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIM 
17X13  111MOIMINIIIM $16.75 $16.75 
21x16 14 111111111.111111.111111111. $19,90 $19.90 
24x18 

35x24 
28x20.111111111:11111=1111 

IIMEDIMIIIIMIIIMI 

fl  

$22.50 
$26.38 

$22.50 
$26.38 

$32.80 $32,80 
42x29 11111111=0111111=111111=111111. $39.05 $39.05 
49x33 IMMO 111111.111111 $45.75 $45.75 
57x38  .111.103111111 $53.50 $53.50 
64x43 fl  $64.00 $64.00 

35x24 

24x181111.11.3 
28x20.1111111011MMIN 

12 

1111111=1111.11111111.1111.1M 
111111111111111 

IMIIIIIIMIIIIIIIIIIIIIII 

$29.95 
$35.40 

$29.95 
$35.40 

$42,50 $42.50 
42x29 12 1111.1.1111.11111= $54.50 $54.50 
49x33 IIIIMIEDIMIIIIIIIIIIIIIIMIII $63.00 $63,00 
57x38 MllnelIllMIIIIIIMIIIIIMI $74.00 $74.00 
64x43 IMIIIIEMIIIIMIIHIIMMIIIIII $87.00 $87.00 
71x47 12 $110.77 	$110.77 EMI. 

MI= 77x52 J1  
IIIIMIIIIIIIIIINIIIMIIIIIMIIIII 

$121.77 

42x29 10 11.1111111.1111111.111111111 $74.10 $74.10 
49x33 10 IIIMIIMIIIIIIIMIII $82.75 $82.75 
67x38 10  MM. $96.20 $96.20 
64x43 10 IM111.11111=1.1 $110.25 $110.26 
71x47 10111111.11111.111111111.11 $118.00 $116.00 
77)(52 10 MIIIIMIIIHIIMIIIIE $135.00 $135.00 
83)(67 10 1111=1111.111111M111 $149.50 $149.50 

IIIIIIIIIE
IIIIIIINIIIIIMIIIIIIII  

57x 38 IIIIIMIIIIII No Bid No Bid 
64x43 1111111111111.311=11111 No Bid No Bid 
71x47 8 IIIIIIIMIIIIMMIIIN No Bid No Bid 
77x62 8  MEM No Bid No Bid 
83367  IIIIIIMEIIIIMIMIII No Bid No Bid 

1.11.1.11111MIIM 
Corrugated Metal Culvert Pipe (6 'Xl" Corrugation) MM. 1.1111111 Picked Up 	Delivered Picked Up Delivered 

Size" Gage MIIIIIIMIIMIlll 
36  11.1.1111111111111.1111.1111 $29 . 85  $29- 85  42 16 $35.10 $35.10 



48  M=1111103 Emu. $40.15 $40.15 
64  OM= .111111M11 $59.50 $59.50 
60 16 $74.39 $74.39 MEI 
66  MIMED $84.14 $84.14 EMI 
72  MECO $92.58 $92.58 
78  IMMO $99.55 $99 . 55  MEI 
84 16 $107.96 $107.96 MEE 
96  MIMEO $121.99 $121.99 NEM 

0111111. 111111M.11111. 
36 14  MIMI $36.50 

1.11200 
$36.50 
$42.75 42 14  111.1.1.01 

48 .1.111.13 .1.1111111. $49.95 $49.95 
54 14  NM= $59.50 $59.50 
60 14 $83.14 $83.14 MN. 
66  MEN= $91.82 $91.82 
72  MEM $100.50 $100.50 
78 14 $107.95 $107.95 MIMI 

60  
84 1111=3 
MEM 

$116.64 $116.64 NEM 
$124.08 $124.08 

96 14  IMEIEUI $132.77 

MEM MIMI 
36  MIME INIMIIIII $50.75 $50.75 
42 mom Esimm 59.00 $59.00 
48 12 MMIIIIII11.1.111111 $68.00 $68.00 
54 12  MM. $80.00 $80.00 
60  MIME MEM $110.00 $110.00 
66  MEM $125.32 IIIMEE 
72  MIIIIIIEMIIIIIIII $130.00 $130.00 
78  MIMED $147.67 $147.67 .1.1.1. 
84  MEM $158.83 $158.83 MINI 

EIIIIE 90  =MEI $192.10 $192.10 
96 12 

121.1.1.110.111.1111.11 
$206.11 $206.11 MIIII 

$210.00 $210.00 102 
108  =Me MIIIIIIIIII $212.00 $212.00 
114 mime $243.90 $243.90 
120 12 $256.60 $256.60 MIEll 

IIMIIIMIIIIMMIIIIIIMIIIMIMM 
48 10 11111111111 $89.90 $89.90 
54 10  IMO= $103.00 $103.00 
60 10  11111.= $110.00 $110.00 
66 10 1=11.1111 $126.00 $126.00 
72 10 111.11.........1. $139.75 $139.75 
78 10 MIIIIIMIIIIIIIII $174.90 $174.90 
84 10 111.111111111=1.1.1111 $195.00 $195.00 
90 10 MN= $207.00 $207.00 
96 10  .....111 $217.00 $217.00 

102 10 I.........I.... $220.00 $220.00 
108 10 1.1111111. $235.00 $235.00 
114 10  MM. $240.00 $240.00 
120 10  111111MI $270.00 $270.00 
26 10 $346.33 $346.33 .11111111 
32 10 $363.15 $363.15 MEI 

.... 
EMI 

38 10 $378.59 $378.59 
144 10 	$395.40 	$395.40 

111111111..... .111111.1 
60 MEM 
66  1111111•11E11111111111111111111=111111111=11 
72 



78 8 
84 8 
90 8 
96 8 

102 8 
108 8 
114 8 
120 8 

Corrugated 	Metal Culvert Pipe (5 ')(1" Corrugation) 
Picked Up Delivered Picked Up Delivered 

Size" Gage 
40x31 16 $31.95 $31.95 
46x36 16 $39.95 $39.95 
53x41 16 $46.00 $46.00 
60x46 16 $64.00 $64.00 
66x51 16 $87.00 $87.00 
73x55 16 $120.00 $120.00 
81x59 16 $129.50 $129.50 
87x63 16 $130.00 $130.00 
95x64 16 $135.00 $135.00 

103x71 16 $143.00 $143.00 
112x75 16 $18000 $180.00 

40x31 14 $36.75 $36.75 
46x36 14 $45.80 $45.80 
5$)(41 14 $49.75 $49.75 
60x46 14 $59.38 $59.38 
66x51 14 $65.00 $65.00 
73x55 14 $70.25 $70.25 
81x59 14 $65.01 $65.01 
87x63 14 $79.50 $79.50 
95x67 14 $85.50 $85.50 

103x71 14 $97.75 $97.75 
112x75 14 $144.00 $144.00 

53x41 12 $63.00 $63.00 
60)06 12 $74.00 $74.00 
66x51 12 $87.00 $87.00 
73x55 12 $130.00 $130.00 
81x59 12 $135.00 $135.00 
87x63 12 $142.70 $142.70 
95x67 12 $161.00 $161.00 

103x71 12 $170.50 $170.50 
112x75 12 $171.00 $171.00 
117x79 12 $179.00 $179.00 
128x83 12 $186.00 $186.00 
137x87 12 $197.00 $197.00 
142x91 12 $250.00 $250.00 

Size" 
81x59 10 $154.00 $154.00 
87x63 10 $174.95 $174.95 
95x67 10 $180.00 $180.00 

103x71 10 $196.00 $196.00 
112x75 10 $206.65 $206.65 
117x79 10 $210.00 $210.00 



128x83 10 $218.00 $218.00 
137x87 10 $263.00 $263.00 
142x91 10 $292.00 $292,00 

66x51 8 
73x55 8 
81x59 8 
87x63 8 
95x64 8 

103x71 8 
112x75 8 
117x79 8 
128x83 8 
137x87 8 
142x91 8 


